Wednesday 24 September

Session 1: Public

In the chair:  Stewart Hosie, Kevin Pringle, John Swinney MSP

10h00 Delegates Assemble

10h30 Address of Welcome by Provost William J Smith, Highland Council

10h45 Adoption of Standing Orders

11h00 Resolutions

12h30 Close of Session

1. A96 ROAD SAFETY

Conference deplores the continuing programme by the Scottish Executive of new three lane carriageways under the cover of ‘crawler lanes’ on the A96. The A96 is the main Trunk road into the North East of Scotland and what it needs and deserves is dual carriageway.   Consistently the Scottish Executive are giving us the cheap option and this is putting our road users at risk and doing nothing to encourage investment in the North East. Three lane roads were abolished many years ago as they were deemed dangerous.  They are now being brought back on the A96 and being called ‘crawler lanes’.  The Highway code definition of a crawler lane is ‘a lane provided for slow moving vehicles to move into to allow traffic to pass’.   What the A96 has is three lane carriageways which allows overtaking in both directions with no priority to uphill traffic.   This situation is repeated on other roads across Scotland. Conference calls on the Scottish Executive to halt the programme of three lane roads and in the meantime to prohibit downhill overtaking on all existing ones to ensure the safety of our road users.

Moray Constituency Association


2. PLANNING APPEALS

Conference calls on the Scottish Executive to change the appeals procedure of Scots Planning Law to make the Reporter the Convener of an Independent Committee rather than the sole arbiter to whom all parties can present their case.

Bridge of Don Branch


3. LITTER

Bearing in mind the disgraceful litter on Scottish roads and public open spaces, Conference calls on the Scottish Executive to improve on the current system of letting contracts for maintenance so that the responsibility is not split between contractors but is the responsibility of a sole, accountable body.

Orchil Branch


4. AFFORDABLE HOUSING

Lack of affordable housing is a serious problem, particularly for young people, and an affordable housing strategy is urgently needed. The causes of this problem are complex and include lack of land, planning restrictions, the right to buy, and market forces which will not be easily remedied. The SNP, therefore, calls on the Scottish Parliament to undertake a comprehensive review of housing and produce an affordable housing strategy which will set out short, medium, and long term action plans to deal with this serious problem.

Inverness West Branch

Amendment

a) Add at end: -

Conference condemns the Lab/Lib coalition for the failure to address this problem in the first session of the reconvened Scottish Parliament and in particular failing to extend to local authorities the entitlement to 50% reduction of Council Tax for (second) holiday home owners.

Inverness East, Nairn & Lochaber CA


5. COUNCIL ELECTIONS

Conference calls on the Scottish Executive to reinstate separate Local Authority Elections.  The mistaken belief that by holding the local elections on the same day as Scottish Parliamentary Elections would encourage a larger turnout for the local elections has now been discredited. The combining of Local Council and Scottish Parliamentary Elections causes confusion and is an abuse of power by Labour for electoral gain.  This abuse of democracy is leading to greater and greater apathy among the voters.

Clydebank Branch


6. DEMOCRATIC PARTICIPATION

Conference, believing that low turnout, such as occurred in the elections of 1st May 2003, is a serious weakness in the functioning of democracy, proposes that, in the course of the next few months, the Party’s National Assembly should examine the case for making voting in local, national, UK and European elections, and in referenda, obligatory by law with appropriate penalties for not voting.  Following examination, Assembly is asked to make recommendations to National Council or Conference.

Linlithgow Constituency Association

Amendment

a) Line 5, after “voting”, add: -
”bearing in mind the right to record one’s dissent or abstention on the ballot paper must be provided for”.

Beith & District Branch

7. LOCAL DEMOCRACY

Conference believes that as part of the process of introducing of STV for local government, funds should be made to allow community councils to conduct postal ballots on the proposed new ward boundaries so that as far as possible the new wards reflect the wishes of local communities.


Furthermore if as part of this process a community clearly expresses a desire to link with wards from another council where practical they should be allowed to do so, even if this means changing existing council boundaries.


This policy would represent a fundamental change to the top-down British approach which has done so much to undermine the legitimacy of local government by implementing changes against local wishes.

Dingwall & District Branch

Amendment

a) delete paragraphs 2 and 3

Inverness East Branch


Session 2: Public

In the chair: Andrew Welsh MSP

13h30 Delegates Assemble

14h00 Resolutions

15h00 Address by Senior Vice Convener Roseanna Cunningham MSP introduced by John Swinney MSP

15h30 Emergency & Topical Resolutions

15h50 Resolutions

17h00 Close of Session

8. TRAFFICKING OF WOMEN

Conference expresses its deep concern at the trafficking of an estimated 300,000 young women into Central Europe and the European Union (EU) each year; is alarmed that hundreds of these women are murdered and thousands coerced into debt bondage and prostitution; notes that false promises of legitimate employment and a better life are used by smuggling gangs to lure women from communities submerged in desperate poverty; calls for a common penalty for trafficking to be adopted across the EU; recognises the need to provide additional resources for The International Organisation for Migration, a body of the United Nations, for its campaign to educate women and girls on the risks of trafficking and to provide medical and psychiatric help,  witness protection and safe houses for those fleeing pimps, and acknowledges that the problem of trafficking can only be solved by addressing the disproportionate impact of poverty on women in Balkans and nations of the former Soviet Union which primarily feed the supply of this traffic in human misery.

Glasgow Pollok Constituency Association

9. INVOLVING YOUNG SCOTS

Conference recognises the importance of young people and the unique part that they will play in the future of the Scottish nation. Conference resolves to create policies that will: -


i. Engage young people in dialogue, in a variety of ways and situations, about issues that are important to them.

ii. Promote strategies that will motivate young people to participate in the political process.

iii. Recognise the pressing need to listen to the views of young people.

iv. Empower young people by making them realise that they can make a difference.


Forfar and District Branch


10. DRUG MISUSE

Conference notes with concern the level of drug misuse and related crime in Scotland and the devastating impact on our local communities and families; further notes the resulting unquantifiable pressures on the NHS, prisons, police, courts and other services that arises; recognises that any reduction in demand for illegal drugs requires adequate resources and attention for both enforcement and treatment measures; condemns the Scottish Government's lack of action to reduce drug misuse and associated crime; and calls for increased rehabilitation and after-care provision throughout Scotland and for control over HM Customs and drugs policy generally to be transferred to the Scottish Parliament; further calls for Scottish Ministers and the Scottish Parliament to instigate a review of existing measures designed to reduce drug misuse and crime.

Richard Lochhead MSP, Elected Member
Nicola Sturgeon MSP, Elected Member

Amendments


a. Last line, after “crime”, delete full stop, add comma, and add;
 “such review to include an assessment of the effect of the decriminalisation of drug misuse on the present situation”.

Aberdeen South CA
11. NATIONAL CREATIVITY

Conference expresses its concern at the ongoing crisis of confidence in the arts in Scotland: recognises that encouraging the cultures of Scotland is a necessary pre-requisite to establishing a sense of national self confidence and national ambition: applauds the decision of the National Convener to integrate culture and heritage in a new portfolio which bases planning for our future on the link between landscape and people and calls on the Shadow Cabinet member responsible to come forward with a new integrated package of proposals that will inform the debate on national renewal and encourage all those who live in Scotland to re-discover the strength and depth of our national creativity and use those attributes to lead Scotland from dependence to independence.

Cunninghame South Constituency Branch
12. ENDING EU TOBACCO SUBSIDIES

Conference condemns the continuing European Union (EU) subsidy of some £800 million annually to tobacco growers; notes that this is in stark contrast to the tiny sums spent on EU smoking prevention initiatives of £1.2 million per annum; believes that EU tobacco subsidies are a gross misuse of public funds and reflect a fundamental contradiction to EU public health policy notes that tobacco subsidies have failed in their original intention of encouraging farmers to grow commercially valued varieties of tobacco and thus reduce imports, as EU grown tobacco is of poor quality and low commercial value; recognises that almost all EU grown tobacco is exported to Central and Eastern  Europe and developing countries  where there are insufficient controls on tar content; notes that 10-20 million people could be fed by food crops grown instead of tobacco, and believes that the EU should begin a phased removal of all tobacco subsidies, using the money thus saved to give farmers direct income support while encouraging crop diversification, early retirement and other safety net schemes. 

Glasgow Pollok Constituency Association

13. BEHAVIOUR IN SCHOOLS

This Conference expresses its concern at the rise in the number of instances of physical and verbal assaults on schoolteachers in recent years.


Conference recognises that the problem of anti-social and disruptive behaviour in Scotland’s schools is having a detrimental effect upon teaching and learning.
Conference calls upon the Scottish Executive to take urgent action to: -

i) Properly resource schools to deal with indiscipline.

ii) grant schools the powers and sanctions to deal effectively with those pupils who are frequently disruptive.

iii) implement policies of ‘zero tolerance’ of violent and abusive behaviour in all state schools.

Newington Branch


Amendment


a) add new part iv)

iv) Reassess both the role and provision of Special Educational Needs placements for children with Emotional and Behavioural Difficulties, including secure accommodation.

Glasgow Maryhill Constituency Branch

14. CONFERENCE TIMING

Conference calls upon the Standing Orders and Agenda Committee to investigate the possibility of holding National Conference during the Parliamentary Recess in October and report back to National Council at the earliest opportunity.

Crossmyloof Branch

15. GREYHOUND RACING

Conference recognises that it vital for the survival and future of greyhound racing within Scotland, to have an Independent Greyhound Racing Regulatory Body, established by and accountable to the Scottish Parliament for their actions and progress.  We further request that the organization will have the statutory powers to collect levies on all dogs racing, and on all betting slips.

Monies generated would be used for the dogs being retired from the track, animal welfare supervision, tagging and recording of dogs, upgrading of racing facilities, and the promotion of the sport for tourism.


The potential and valuable contribution that greyhound racing has to offer our tourism industry, both locally and nationally should not be underestimated, nor should the welfare of those dogs involved.
 
Dumfries Constituency Branch

Thursday 25 September 

Session 3: Public

In the chair: Alasdair Morgan MSP

09h30 Delegates Assemble

10h00 Resolutions

11h00 Developing Campaigning I – Online print and design

11h15 Resolutions

12h30 Close of Session
16. NORDIC COUNCIL


Conference recognising the historic trading and social links of our Nation with Scandinavia and other North Sea and North Atlantic communities; noting the community of interests that we share with them and the advantages to all socially, economically and environmentally from inter Governmental and Inter Parliamentary links; calls on both the Scottish Parliament and the Scottish Executive to enter into formal dialogue and to seek to obtain appropriate representation for Scotland at and with both West Norden and the Nordic Council.

Edinburgh East & Musselburgh Constituency Association


17. FAIR TRADE

In the light of the increasingly unfair trading system, brought about by the rules of the World Trade Organisation and mitigating against the poorer countries of the world, Conference proposes that SNP activists and all elected members (whether to Councils or Parliaments) should encourage their communities to follow the lead of Aberfeldy which has become the first Fair trade Town in Scotland. As individuals, members can encourage the use of fair-traded products in their own workplaces but SNP local authorities should have policies to buy ethically wherever possible, and also to seek all opportunities to invest ethically, thus not only assisting poor countries, but also contributing to improving the environment.

North Tayside Constituency Association

Amendment

a) At at end,  “Further, the SNP believes that the legal restrictions prohibiting public bodies from considering ethical issues in their procurement policies must be scrapped.”

Renfrew Town Branch


18. MARITIME STRATEGY


Conference noting that Scotland is an island Nation with numerous island and archipelago communities having a rich maritime history and containing a vibrant maritime sector; noting further the success of the Superfast Rosyth-Zeebrugge service, the ongoing consideration of super port developments at Scapa Flow and Hunterston and fast ferry services on the Rivers Clyde and Forth amongst other matters; calls on the Scottish Parliament and the Scottish Executive to develop and maintain a distinct maritime strategy for Scotland to ensure that growth and development of shipping services and this sector.

Edinburgh East & Musselburgh Constituency Association

Amendment
 
a) add “and Invergordon” after “Hunterston”.


Dingwall & District Branch


19. TIBET

Conference deplores the continued repression of human, civil, and religious rights in Tibet by the Peoples Republic of China and also wishes to highlight, in particular, the fact that these long-standing abuses of the fundamental rights of the Tibetan people are a blatant breach of the UN International Covenant on Civil and Political Rights to which the Beijing government was a signatory in 1998.


Conference condemns the fifty-year old occupation of Tibet by the Beijing government; calls for the immediate release of all Tibetan political and religious prisoners; urges all SNP Parliamentarians to raise the matter, in their respective Parliaments, of a UN-supervised referendum on the constitutional future of the Tibetan people; and resolves that an SNP government will demand that the UN Human Rights Commission compels the Peoples Republic of China to abide by its treaty obligations with regard to Tibet.


Conference further calls on the international community as a whole to continue in comprehensive dialogue with the Beijing government, making it clear that economic investment within the Peoples Republic of China, by the international community, cannot be divorced from the speedy resolution of human rights within Tibet.

Linwood Sub-Branch


20. MILITARY EXPORTS CONTROL

Conference recognises that it is not just weapons of mass destruction that undermine international peace and security.   Conventional weapons and small arms continue to have a devastating effect, particularly on developing countries.   The proliferation of arms and military equipment fuels conflict, undermines development and facilitates political repression.   Under Labour the UK remains a major promoter, producer and exporter of such equipment and, since 1997, the UK has licensed the sale of arms and military equipment to 20 countries engaged in conflict, many of which are guilty of serious human rights violations.


The SNP welcomes the Export Control Act 2002, yet notes that there remain significant loopholes.   In particular the SNP is concerned that the Government does not intend to introduce controls on UK arms brokers operating out with its borders, despite its 2001 manifesto commitment to do so, and calls for a reversal of this decision.


SNP members at every level will support initiatives to reduce the damage caused by the proliferation of conventional weapons and small arms.   With independence the SNP recognises that a continuation of some arms and security exports will be necessary to sustain a domestic defence industry, enabling Scotland to achieve its security objectives.   However an SNP Government will implement a military export control strategy based on the following principles, in line with our international policy objectives of developing a peaceful, stable and just global community: -


i. A total ban on the sale of military, security or police equipment, the provision of training to military, security or police personnel and the sale of products classified as dual-use to any country with a record of human rights violations; to any country which is engaged in armed aggression towards another state or liable to become engaged in armed aggression towards another state in the foreseeable future; or which is undergoing civil conflict.


ii. All applications for export licenses for the sale of controlled items or services (as above) will be scrutinised by a parliamentary committee before the license is granted and a public register of such applications will be made available.   Applications will be dealt with on a case-by-case basis.


iii. End user agreements, including commitments not to divert or re-transfer controlled items or services, will be required before any sale is authorised.


iv. The scrutiny process will take into account the short-term and cumulative effects of the sale of controlled items or services on development in the end user country, on the presumption that any deal that would divert scarce resources from economic development or basic services such as health and education should be blocked.


v. An SNP Government will continue to offer insurance and protection against non-payment to Scottish companies doing business with developing countries through a Scottish Export Credits Guarantee Department, but only for productive expenditure (ie projects which facilitate economic or social development), not for arms deals.


vi. Scottish arms brokers or Scottish companies producing or dealing in controlled items or services outwith Scotland will be required to apply for export licenses under the same criteria as companies operating in Scotland.   Scottish arms brokers or companies dealing to embargoed destinations will be subject to prosecution, wherever they commit the offence.


vii. Private military or security companies registered in Scotland will be required to obtain the agreement of the Scottish International Affairs Development before accepting overseas contracts.


viii. The use and effect of controlled items and services in end user countries will be monitored by our diplomatic service and this information will be made public.


ix. An independent Scotland will work with like-minded countries in the EU and international community to combat the proliferation of conventional weapons and small arms and strengthen controls on the arms trade.

Crossmyloof Branch

Amendments

a) Delete sub-paragraph i), re-number sub-paragraphs as necessary

Haddington Branch

b) Sub-paragraph viii) – delete “and this information will be made public”.

Haddington Branch

c) Delete sub-paragraph vi)

Glasgow Anniesland Constituency Branch


21. LAW CONCERNING COUPLES

Conference broadly welcomes recent proposals to modernise the law concerning all couples.   The SNP will positively pursue an equal opportunities agenda to ensure that pension rights, property rights and inheritance rights are brought into the 21st century.   The law should have respect for the different lifestyles and choices made by those within Scottish society.

Glasgow Maryhill Constituency Branch

Amendment

a) Add after second sentence;
”To achieve this an Official Register should be established to allow co-habiting couples to register their entitlement to obtain those rights”.

Arbroath & District Branch

Session 4: Public

In the chair:  Neil MacCormick MEP, Dr Winifred Ewing

13h30 Delegates Assemble

14h00 Emergency & Topical Resolutions 

14h20 Address by Alex Salmond MP, Leader, Westminster Parliamentary Group introduced by Margaret Ewing MSP 

14h50 Resolutions

16h00 Close of Session

22. CONVENTION ON THE FUTURE OF EUROPE

1. The Scottish National Party reaffirms its intention to pursue the goal of Scottish independence in the context of the European Union, where Scotland must at the earliest possible date take her place as one of the Member States, alongside of the many medium to small sized states now participating in the enlarged Union.

2. The Scottish National Party further reaffirms its belief in the concept of the European Union as a confederation of sovereign states exercising only those powers that the states confer on it, and its belief that such a Union should be properly established under a clear and intelligible constitution respecting principles of democracy and human rights, as well as those of subsidiarity and proportionality. 

3. In this light, the Party: -

i. Welcomes the draft Constitution put forward by the Convention on the Future of Europe and referred by the European Council to an Intergovernmental Conference (‘IGC’) in autumn 2003 aimed at producing an agreed constitution treaty for ratification by all Member States of the Union;

ii. Considers that this squares satisfactorily with the SNP’s conception of confederation;

iii. Welcomes the acknowledgement of the equality of Member States in the proposed institutional structure of the Union;

iv. Notes that the draft Constitution adequately respects the States’ sovereignty over fiscal and constitutional matters;

v. Finds satisfactory the proposed framework concerning the Foreign and Security Policy of the Union;

vi. Finds satisfactory the proposals concerning Justice and Home Affairs given the need for effective responses to cross-border crime and risks of terrorism in an enlarged Union without internal frontiers.

4. But with great regret the Party considers that the provisions in the draft constitution concerning the Common Fisheries Policy (‘CFP’) are gravely adverse to Scottish interests, in particular in respect of the provision according to which the Union is accorded an exclusive competence concerning the conservation of marine biological resources under the CFP?

5. Accordingly the Party demands that the United Kingdom government give urgent priority in the Intergovernmental Conference to amending provisions relating to the CFP, in particular that respecting exclusive competence.

6. A further important point for amendment is the Protocol on the Euratom Treaty, which continues the unjustified privileging of atomic energy over energy from other sources.

7. In any event, the Party considers that the adoption of any European Union constitution after the 2003 IGC must give expression to the sovereignty of the people, and therefore requires confirmation by a referendum held after due opportunity for informed public debate prior to any ratification by the Westminster Parliament. 

Standing Orders & Agenda Committee (on behalf of National Assembly)

Amendments

a) Paragraph 5 – delete all after “CFP”.

Trade Union Group
Dollar Branch

b) After Paragraph 6, insert new paragraph and renumber;
”The Party also notes with concern Article 5 which states that the European Union ‘shall respect their (members) essential state functions, including those for ensuring the territorial integrity of the state’, and agrees that ‘including’ to ‘state’ is removed, will be unable to support the European Union constitution”.

After above, insert new paragraph and renumber;
”The Party believes that Article 43’s reference to the European Union aim to ‘reinforce its integration process’ must be more clearly defined and the limits of such integration clarified if the European Union is to be truly confederal rather than federal”.

Glasgow Pollock Constituency Association

c) delete Paragraph 4 and replace with;

4. The Party also welcomes Article 1.13 of the draft constitution which states that fisheries like agriculture will be shared competence between the EU and the National Government, and calls on the UK Government to press for a complete renegotiation of the CFP to ensure that as much as possible of the management of fisheries in UK waters is controlled by the communities most dependent on them.

Paragraph 5 – delete all after “…to amending..” and add;
”article 1.12 which confers an exclusive competence on the European Union concerning the conservation of marine biological resources, and ensures that the marine biological resources in UK Territorial Waters and in those waters over the UK Continental Shelf Designated Area be controlled in a shared competence in a manner similar to the control of land-based biological resources”.

Kilmarnock and Loudoun Constituency Association

d) Paragraph 7 – delete all after “sovereignty of the people”.

Linlithgow Constituency Association


e) Paragraph 2 – delete all after “and proportionality”.

add new paragraph 3;


”The Scottish National Party therefore calls for the Constitution to be clear and precise as to the powers to be conferred on the Union and the powers to be retained by the Member States; these latter to include (at least) every aspect of taxation as well as education, health, fishing, energy, social policy, justice and the Constitution.  Only when the Constitution as proposed by the IGC is available for referendum and ratification shall we be able to determine whether we would recommend to the Scottish people approval or rejection”.

Dollar Branch

23. EUROPEAN STRUCTURAL FUNDS

Conference welcomes the progress being made to develop Structural Funds Programmes in Scotland and steps taken to develop a broader strategy concerning European funding issues in preparation for the enlargement of the European Union; believes these will have a lasting positive impact but notes the failure of New Labour Government to secure the retention of Objective One Status for any area of Scotland, deprived the country of resources needed to develop Structural Funds Programmes and reduced the scope, impact and likely success of the outcomes we seek in both rural and post industrial communities; believes that relative poverty should be a significant determinant of EU Structural Funds allocations and calls on the EU to give levels of relative poverty higher priority when deciding how resources are allocated.

Glasgow Pollok Constituency Association
Session 5: Internal

In the chair: Alasdair Morgan MSP

16h00 Reports of National Office Bearers followed by Amendments to the Constitution & Rules

17h15 Close of Session

24. NEW CLAUSE 17, B, 6

Not more than 2 Scottish National Party Councillors from each Local Authority area where 25% or five councillors, whichever is lowest, of the Council have been elected to serve as SNP Councillors.


Paisley South Constituency Branch

25. CLAUSE 125

After ‘to consider such approval’, insert new sentence.
’Where a person to be interviewed as a Prospective Parliamentary Candidate or as a Prospective Parliamentary Election Agent has indicated a preference to represent a particular constituency or region the majority of members of the appointed committee shall be drawn from within that Regional Association area.


Lewis & Harris Branch
Friday 26 September

Session 6: Public

In the chair: Fiona Hyslop MSP, Cllr Peter Johnston

09h30 Delegates Assemble

10h00 Resolutions

12h20 President’s Prize presentation by Dr Winifred Ewing

12h30 Close of Session

26. PARLIAMENTARY LEVY

Conference calls upon every SNP MSP, MP and MEP to be levied £250 per month and that the proceeds be ring-fenced for HQ national campaigning purposes.


Newington Branch

Amendment

a. Remove all after “every” and replace with, “member of the SNP to make a monthly donation to the Party in line with their own personal circumstances and calls upon MSPs, MPs and MEPs to lead by example”.

Eastwood Constituency Association


27. EXECUTIVE PAY

This Conference notes the on-going debate on corporate governance and in particular the debate on executive pay.   This Conference recognises that corporates have a responsibility to all stakeholders, and to that end supports the establishment of a split supervisory and management boards, as is the typical arrangement in most of Continental Europe.


Within this structure, the supervisory board, consisting of non-executive directors, would have a legal responsibility to reflect the interests of all stakeholders, define strategy and appoint the management board.   Within this, management board incentivisation and remuneration would be an issue for the supervisory board.   The management board would be empowered to run their business on a day-to-day basis.


Shareholders, as of right, will still have a pre-eminent position, but the evolution to a split board with differing responsibilities would both put us in the European mainstream, and build upon best practise in developing an inclusive society for Scotland.


Supervisory board members will be elected at the shareholders meeting, serving for a fixed term, and shall, as well as offering professional expertise, be in a position to reflect the interests of all stakeholders.


The establishment of dual boards for large corporates signals our desire to deliver an entrepreneurial Scotland, but also a Scotland where businesses represent the wider community interests.

Clyde Valley Sub Branch

Amendment

a) Insert after 1st sentence of paragraph 2;
”Supervisory boards will also include members elected by and from the workplace to represent the interests of the employees outwith the participation of institutional shareholders”.

Glasgow Anniesland Constituency Branch

28. SCOTTISH PARLIAMENT POWERS

That Parliament has failed to live up to the hopes and expectations of the Scottish people due, not only to the inadequacies of the Lib/Lab executive, but also by the limitation of its powers.


In order that Parliament can re-engage with the people we should take every campaigning opportunity to have the powers detailed within Schedule 5 of the Scotland Act 1998 repatriated to the Scottish Parliament.


We should also be prepared to work with any other Party, which supports that principle.

Edinburgh East Branch

Amendment

a) Delete final sentence

Glasgow Anniesland Constituency Branch


29. SEWEL MOTIONS

Conference notes: -


i. The increasing number of Sewel Motions adopted by the Scottish Executive as part of its legislative programme.

ii. That Sewel Motions were devised as a means to allow the Westminster Parliament to legislate on behalf of the Scottish Parliament in exceptional circumstances; where parallel legislation was being considered at Westminster.

iii. That in the first Parliament there were 59 Sewel Motions, despite expectations that there would be no more than 4 per year.

Conference believes: -

i. That the increasing use of Sewel Motions deprives the Scottish Parliament of the opportunity to properly scrutinise measures that significantly impact on Scotland, and to tailor these Bills for specific Scottish requirements.

ii. that the dependency on Sewel Motions can only undermine the Parliament.

iii. That only under exceptional circumstances should Sewel Motions be employed.


Conference resolves to call upon the Scottish Executive to review its use of Sewels and produce guidelines on what issues they should be used.

North Tayside Constituency Association

Amendments

a) Insert at end;
”Conference urges the Scottish Parliament through its subject committees to scrutinise the progress of bills in the Westminster Parliament for which it has granted consent by Sewel motion; to comment on amendments lodged to such bills during their passage; and to publish a report on such bills in sufficient time to allow amendments to be lodged at the final report stage”.

Edinburgh Central Constituency Branch

b) Delete last paragraph and replace with;
”Conference resolves to call upon the Scottish Parliament to introduce a new Standing Order creating a negative procedure, by absolute majority, to be required before Scottish Executive consent can be given to a Sewell motion”.

Linlithgow Constituency Association

30. CENTRAL HEATING

Conference notes with concern that the Scottish Executive Central Heating Programme would appear to be at best haphazard and at worst badly executed by some of the contractors appointed by the EAGA Partnership. Conference therefore requires that the SNP find ways of initiating an inquiry into the scheme with a view to improving the efficiency and safety of the installation, together with an independent inspection of the installation.

North Tayside Constituency Association


31. RECYCLING

The Scottish National Party affirms its commitment to an ecological Scotland while recognising that Scotland currently recycles among the lowest percentage of waste among EU countries, despite rapidly increasing costs of alternative means of disposal.


Conference therefore: -


i. calls upon the Scottish Executive and all local authorities to treat as a priority the achievement of the target set by the Executive to increase the amount of municipal waste recycled in Scotland from 7.5% this year to 25% by the year 2006 and 55% by 2020;

ii. instructs the Party’s elected representatives to introduce targets to reduce the amount of waste actually produced over the same periods and draw up plans for their implementation;

iii. demands that, through schools, community education and other appropriate media, there be introduced a programme of public enlightenment on the benefits of recycling and the long-term dangers of failing to reach the set targets.

East Lothian Constituency Association

Amendment

a) Insert at end;
iv. Urges the repatriation to Scotland of all proceeds of the Landfill Tax raised in Scotland, which proceeds would be used for the promotion of recycling and other alternatives to landfill in Scotland.

Edinburgh Central Constituency Branch


32. PENSIONS

Conference condemns the decision of employers in Scotland to end final salary pension schemes for existing and new employees.


Conference calls upon all Scottish National Party Parliamentarians, in their respective legislatures to campaign to secure appropriate legislation that will protect existing pension rights and put an end to the uncertainty faced by many working people in Scotland. 

Conference calls not only upon our parliamentarians, but also the party generally to campaign on pension issues, prioritising the following elements: -

i. The aim that all working people should have access to a secure income in retirement that enables them at least to maintain a standard of living comparable to their final years in employment; 

ii. The need to protect and encourage good final salary schemes: to promote good defined contribution schemes; and to work to make a success of stakeholder pensions; 

iii. The principle that employers have a shared long-term responsibility for decent pension provision;

iv. An end to the right of employers to modify or discontinue schemes/contributions without restraint and guaranteed employee consultation;

v. Government to be pressed to introduce legislation that will ensure pension entitlements are afforded as much protection in law as wages and salaries;
vi. Employee contributions to be facilitated through tax assistance;
vii. Companies running final salary schemes to be recognized and rewarded;
viii. A new defined benefit scheme to be created potentially through offering tax concessions to business with final salary schemes;
ix. Pensions to be treated in law as deferred salary;
x. Accounting procedure FRS17 to be relaxed;
xi. A regulatory body for the pensions industry to be created;
xii. The European insolvency employment directive to be adopted to protect employees when companies become insolvent or when pensions are illegally raided;
xiii. Surpluses in occupational pension funds to be distributed as block payments or increased benefits to scheme members without Inland Revenue or Treasury reductions;
xiv. For governance of schemes to be shared equally by employers and employees trustees; 
xv. Workers to be required to become members of any operational final salary scheme operated by an employer;
xvi. For a minimum compulsory employer contribution of at least 10% to be introduced to all forms of occupational pension, including stakeholder schemes, and with the specific inclusion of freelance and casual workers;
xvii. For the dependants' benefits to be protected and for these to be distributed on a non- discriminatory basis that is fair to all regardless of marital status or sexual orientation.
Conference also calls upon MSP's to specifically press the Scottish Executive to investigate the Stakeholder Pension Scheme regarding agency labour, who, because of short term employment contracts are not offered participation in this scheme by agency employers. 


Conference believes that the issue of Occupational Pensions is fundamental in the life of every Scot and should feature prominently in our vision of what an independent Scotland will be like.


Trade Union Group

Crossmyloof Branch

Amendments

a) add xviii.
”The TUPE regulations as enacted in the UK should be amended to include pensions provision to be on the same basis as with the old employer/contractor”.

Inverness East Branch

b) delete bullet point x., and renumber accordingly

Linlithgow Constituency Association
Session 7: Public

In the chair: Roseanna Cunningham MSP, Jim Mather MSP

13h30 Delegates Assemble

14h00 Emergency & Topical Resolutions

14h30 Address by John Swinney MSP, National Convener; Leader, Scottish Parliamentary Group introduced by Roseanna Cunningham MSP

15h00 Resolutions

16h00 Close of Session

33. STIMULATING NATIONAL SELF-BELIEF

Conference agrees that the National Executive Committee appoint an ad hoc committee of Party members with the remit of stimulating imaginative, constructive Party activity out with Council and Parliamentary Chambers, to generate and promote patriotic self-belief throughout the electorate, inspired by our own belief in the potential value of independence and by our pride in the historic integrity of the Scottish nation, formed as it has been over more than a thousand years, and still is today, woven together to work for a better Scotland and a better world, using the principles of social democracy.

Linlithgow Constituency Association


34. STRATEGIC TRANSPORT AUTHORITY


Conference welcomes the proposals for a Strategic Transport Authority for Scotland; notes that at present the Scottish Executive whilst responsible for ferries and buses has limited powers over aviation and rail; in particular that whilst the Executive own and fund HIAL safety and security within internal Scottish flights remain within the competency and remit of the CAA and the Department of Transport’ moreover that though the Executive fund the Scotrail franchise development and enhancement of the Scottish Rail Network remains with the Strategic Rail Authority; believes that in order to be able to deliver the inter modal coordination that is required and the level of investment in infrastructure that is needed in Transport for Scotland in C21; powers in respect of security and safety for internal flights and the funding and direction of internal rail services be devolved to the Strategic Transport Authority.

Edinburgh East & Musselburgh Constituency Association
 

35. LEGACIES

Bearing in mind the debt of gratitude which the Party owes posthumously to those members whose generosity has been expressed in legacies, National Conference resolves that a list of legacies received shall be published annually, unless specifically requested otherwise by the testator/testatrix or executor/executrix.

Musselburgh Branch


36. BANNOCKBURN RALLY

Conference notes the declining numbers of Party members attending the annual Bannockburn Rally and is concerned to ensure that we continue to mark this important historical landmark in the history of Scottish Independence.


Conference requests that the National Executive reconsider the arrangements made for the Rally with a view to organising a weekend summer school in Stirling on the same weekend which could be preceded by a brief Rally at the Borestone followed by a march to the centre of Stirling.


Conference notes the objective of such a move would be to open the debate on Independence to new international thinking and involve many more overseas contributors, expatriates and younger people.

Roseanna Cunningham MSP
Jim Mather MSP
Stewart Maxwell MSP

Session 8: Internal

In the chair: Alasdair Morgan MSP

1600 Resolutions

1715 Close of Session

37. CENTRAL MEMBERSHIP SYSTEM

Annual Conference instructs the National Executive Committee to develop and implement a Central Membership System.


Further, Annual Conference agrees that the minimum standard membership of the Scottish National Party should cost £12 per annum with a concessionary rate of £8 per annum commencing 1 October 2003.


Annual Conference agrees that on commencement of the Central Membership System on 1 January 2004, no further HQ dues from branches and Constituency Associations will be payable with the exception of exceptional levies as agreed by National Council from time to time.


Annual Conference instructs the National Executive Committee to ensure that, irrespective of the membership fee paid, 25% of all membership dues received will be paid directly to the Branch a member has joined.

Broughty Ferry Branch
Stewart Hosie, National Secretary


Amendments


a) Paragraph 1 – delete “and implement”, substitute “proposals for”.  Add at end “such proposals to be tabled for discussion at a Special National Conference following full consultation with the membership.”


Delete all after Paragraph 1

West Renfrewshire Constituency Association

b) Add at end, “The individual should choose which branch they shall join and the membership fee shall follow the member to their chosen branch.”

Paisley North Constituency Association

c) Paragraph 4 – delete “25%”, insert “50%”.

Inverness East, Nairn and Lochaber Constituency Association

d) Paragraph 4 – delete “25%”, insert “33%”.

Moray Constituency Association

e) Paragraph 2 – substitute “concessionary rate of £8 per annum”, with “concessionary rate of £5 per annum”.

Lorne-Harbour Branch
Beith & District Branch

f) Paragraph 2, line 3 – after “annum”, add “and that a scale of additional voluntary membership rates, above the standard rate of £12 should be encouraged for members who wish to support the Party at a higher financial level.”

Beith & District Branch

38. RECRUITMENT 

Conference agrees that the National Executive Committee produce a pro-forma plan for use, where required, at constituency level, to campaign continuously for significant recruitment of new members and active supporters, particularly people who are willing to undertake training in canvassing and study all aspects of the case for independence.


Conference agrees that the plan be submitted to National Council by March 2004, for approval and adoption, the plan to include provision of appropriate resources by HQ for use by Branches in the campaign.


Linlithgow Constituency Association


Saturday 27 September

Session 9:  Internal

In the chair: Stewart Hosie

0930 Delegates Assemble

0940 Election of National Office Bearers

1000 Ranking of European Candidates

1130 Close of Session

Session 10: Public

In the chair: Alex Salmond MP

11h30 Address by a representative of the European Free Alliance 

11h35 Address by a representative of Plaid Cymru

11h40 Developing Campaigning II - A New Electoral Database

12h55 Financial Appeal

12h05 Announcement of Results of Election of National Office Bearers

12h10 Close of Session

Session 11: Internal

In the chair: Roseanna Cunningham MSP

1210 Election of National Executive Committee and thirty Elected Members of National Council.

1230 Close of Session

Session 12: Public

In the chair: Roseanna Cunningham MSP, John Swinney MSP

13h45 Delegates Assemble

14h00 Emergency & Topical Resolutions 

14h30 Announcement of Ranking of European Candidates

14h35 Developing Campaigning III – Europe 2004 campaign launch

14h45 Resolutions

15h15 Address by Dr Winifred Ewing, President, introduced by John Swinney MSP

15h59 Announcement of Results of Election of National Executive Committee

16h00 Close of Conference

39. INDEPENDENCE ROADMAP

Conference instructs the NEC to present a plan for independence to March National Council 2004.   The SNP will campaign on a “We’ll be Better-Off Independent” theme.   Complete briefings on key issues will be prepared and distributed enabling a three-year cohesive campaign building up to the 2007 elections.

Ardrossan Branch

Amendment

a) Delete “March National Council 2004”, insert “Annual National Conference 2004”.

Clyde Valley Sub-branch

40. PROGRESSIVE TAXATION

This Conference, mindful of the approaching Westminster elections, calls for the Scottish National Party to formulate a progressive taxation policy. Both income tax and National Insurance contributions must be graduated to take more account of the differentials in income in Scottish society. The SNP must establish in the minds of the Scottish people the kind of redistribution of wealth we seek to implement following Independence.

Trade Union Group


41. INTEGRATED TAX AND BENEFITS

Conference reaffirms its commitment to an integrated tax and benefit system, and the combination of income tax and National Insurance into a single income tax.


Furthermore, Conference believes that the tax threshold should be linked to the minimum wage, so that someone working a standard 35 hour week on the minimum wage would be exempt from direct taxation.


Conference also believes that the same threshold be used for benefit calculation and that just as those above would be eligible for tax, so those below would be eligible for benefit and the same rate as basic tax.



Not only would this allow for a simpler, fairer and more transparent system, but it would also pave the way for the integration of pensions and child benefit through the introduction of universal age related non means tested tax allowances. 

Dingwall & District Branch

Amendment

a) Paragraph 2 – after “direct taxation”, add “provided they have no other taxable income”.

Linlithgow Constituency Association
PAGE  

